
BID 12-15, SUPPORT VEHICLES
TABSHEET

Recommended low bidder, outlined in bold Page 1 of 3

Allan Vigil Ford
Net 30

Hardy Family Ford
Net 30 days

O.G. Hughes & Sons, Inc.
Net 30

Rush Truck Center
Net 30

Wade Ford, Inc.
Net 30

1. 2012 Dry Box Truck 
QTY 

2

Make and Model International 4300 SBA 4 x 2
Price per each Vehicle No Bid No Bid $89,751.00 No Bid
Indicate earliest date of delivery 12 weeks

Indicate any manufacturer and/or dealer’s
warranties

Page 9 of tak quote
60 month/125,000 miles

4500 hours eng. Elect. & injectors

2. 2012 Ford E350 Van 
QTY 

4

Make and Model Ford E350 Cargo Van Ford E350 Cargo Van E3E Ford E350
Price per each Vehicle $20,287.00 $21,354.00 $20,217.00
Indicate earliest date of delivery 8-10 weeks 6-12 weeks ARO approx. 90 days ARO

Indicate any manufacturer and/or dealer’s
warranties

See included CD See attached See attached

3. 2012 Ford E350 Van  14' cutaway cargo van
QTY 

1

Make and Model Ford E350 Cutaway
Ford E350 Cutaway E3F 176 wb 

w/body Ford E350/Smyrna Cargo
Price per each Vehicle $25,137.00 $25,364.00 $24,539.00
Indicate earliest date of delivery 8-10 weeks 6-14 weeks ARO approx. 120 days ARO

Indicate any manufacturer and/or dealer’s
warranties

See included CD See attached See attached

4. 2012 Ford 550 super cab w/ 12' cargo box
QTY 

9

Make and Model Ford F550 Super Cab Ford F550 X5G w/body Ford F550 /Smyrna Cargo
Price per each Vehicle $40,935.00 $41,162.00 $40,728.00
Indicate earliest date of delivery 18-20 weeks 16-22 weeks ARO approx. 120-150 days ARO
Indicate any manufacturer and/or dealer’s
warranties See included CD

See attached

5. 2012 Ford 350 extended cab pick-up w/ ladder rack 
QTY 

4

Make and Model Ford F350 Super Cab Ford F350 X3A w/body Ford F350/Reading Body

Price per each Vehicle $31,251.00 gas/$37,523.00 diesel $34,895.00
$28,196.00 - $27,796.00 w/ 

Knapheide Body
Indicate earliest date of delivery 12-14 weeks 16-22 weeks ARO approx. 110-120-days ARO
Indicate any manufacturer and/or dealer’s
warranties See included CD See attached See attached 



BID 12-15, SUPPORT VEHICLES
TABSHEET

Recommended low bidder, outlined in bold Page 2 of 3

Allan Vigil Ford
Net 30

Hardy Family Ford
Net 30 days

O.G. Hughes & Sons, Inc.
Net 30

Rush Truck Center
Net 30

Wade Ford, Inc.
Net 30

6. 2012 Ford E350 cutaway van w/ mounted cabinets
QTY 

5

Make and Model Ford E350 Cutaway Ford E350 Cutaway E3F w/body Ford E350/Smyrna Cargo
Price per each Vehicle $27,457.00 $27,684.00 $26,790.00
Indicate earliest date of delivery 8-10 weeks 10-16 weeks ARO approx. 120 days ARO

Indicate any manufacturer and/or dealer’s
warranties

See included CD
See attached See attached

7. 2012 Ford E350 cutaway van w/ ladder keeper
QTY 

3

Make and Model Ford E350 Cutaway Ford E350 Cutaway E3F w/body Ford E350/Smyrna Cargo
Price per each Vehicle $29,644.00 $29,871.00 $28,997.00
Indicate earliest date of delivery 8-10 weeks 10-16 weeks ARO approx. 120 days ARO
Indicate any manufacturer and/or dealer’s
warranties See included CD

See attached See attached

8.
2012 Ford E350 cutaway van w/ Reading Lo-Pro
Service Body

QTY 
16

Make and Model Ford E350 Cutaway Ford E350 Cutaway E3F w/body Ford E350/Reading
Price per each Vehicle $32,237.00 $31,625.00 $31,296.00
Indicate earliest date of delivery 8-10 weeks 10-16 weeks ARO approx. 120 days ARO
Indicate any manufacturer and/or dealer’s
warranties See included CD

See attached See attached

9. 2012 Ford E350 cutaway van w/ 14' cargo box bed
QTY 

2

Make and Model Ford E350 Cutaway Ford E350 Cutaway E3F w/body Ford E350/Smyrna Cargo
Price per each Vehicle $28,807.00 $29,034.00 $28,126.00
Indicate earliest date of delivery 8-10 weeks 10-16 weeks ARO approx. 120 days ARO
Indicate any manufacturer and/or dealer’s
warranties See included CD

See attached See attached

10.
2012 Ford F350 4 x 4 pick-up w/ Reading Classic II
Body

QTY 
1

Make and Model Ford F350 Crew Cab 4  x 4
Ford F350 Crew Cab 4  x 4 W3B 

w/body Ford F350/Reading

Price per each Vehicle $32,583.00 $33,045.00
$32,279.00 - $31,628.00 

w/Knapheide Body
Indicate earliest date of delivery 12-14 weeks 16-22 weeks ARO approx. 120 days ARO
Indicate any manufacturer and/or dealer’s
warranties See included CD

See attached See attached



BID 12-15, SUPPORT VEHICLES
TABSHEET

Recommended low bidder, outlined in bold Page 3 of 3

Allan Vigil Ford
Net 30

Hardy Family Ford
Net 30 days

O.G. Hughes & Sons, Inc.
Net 30

Rush Truck Center
Net 30

Wade Ford, Inc.
Net 30

11. 2012 Ford 450 regular cab pick-up bucket truck 
QTY 

1

Make and Model Ford F550 w/Versalift SST-37ENH
Ford F450 /Versalift SST 
37EHH/Knapheide Body

Price per each Vehicle No Bid No Bid $69,853.00 $69,208.00
Indicate earliest date of delivery 4/27/2011 approx. 150-180 days ARO
Indicate any manufacturer and/or dealer’s
warranties See attachments See attached

12. 2012 Ford Escape, XLT
QTY 

4

Make and Model Ford Escape XCT w/ 3.0L V6 Ford Escape XLT FWD VOD Ford Escape
Price per each Vehicle $20,804.00 $20,998.00 $20,769.00
Indicate earliest date of delivery 6-8 weeks 8-12 weeks ARO approx. 90 days ARO

Indicate any manufacturer and/or dealer’s
warranties

See included CD
See attached

11-18-11 is the last order date for 
the 2012 Escape See attached

Notes/Exceptions:

Exceptions to the specs are made, 
see vendor's response. 

Option 1 - bodyside access steps 
$642.00

Option 2 - 12vDC emergency hyd 
power $463.00

Note: Delivery times are estimates 
based on current information but, are 
subject to manufacturer's production.
Exceptions are listed in bid response. 
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